
2022 was an exceptional harvest in terms of quality 
and the quantity of grapes picked. Our vineyards 
gave us fine and healthy bunches of grapes which 
benefited from this year’s sunshine.

Vinification is ongoing to provide us with future 
cuvées which undoubtedly will perform well in 
future competitions and/or coming guide-books, 
well in-keeping with the champagnes we currently 
propose.

A harvest of stars in the Hachette wine guide for 
2023: 2 stars for ORIGINE: “this cuvée will imme-
diately charm you with its nose whose minerality 
comes first, and then once aired displays a wide 
range of aromas…” and 2 stars for MEMOIRE 
2013: “… a vintage brut with a lot of body ; it is 
smooth and weathered, roasted to the nose and 
honeyed on the palate.”

For the coming end of the year we suggest you  
discover our new vintage of the Blanc de Blanc  
Premier Cru Saint Nicaise 2014. In terms of wines, 
the year 2014 was mild and rainy. Grapes “took their 
time” to mature, preserving their acidity and deve-
loping complex aromas. The grape picking took 
place in September with a harvest of Chardonnays 
which were perfectly and superbly ripe.

We wish you happy end-of-year celebrations and 
enjoyable tasting moments.
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